
From: R4_Regional_Hearing_Clerk
To: Shannon Miller; R4_Regional_Hearing_Clerk; Russo, Celina
Cc: Dave Ketchum
Subject: RE: EPA Penalty Payment Docket No. CWA0420220321(b)
Date: Monday, June 26, 2023 3:57:52 PM

Thank you!
 
Shannon L. Richardson
Shannon L. Richardson | Region 4 RHC
Paralegal Specialist
General/Criminal Law & Cross-Office Support
U.S. Environmental Protection Agency | Region 4
61 Forsyth Street, Atlanta, GA. 30303
Office: 404.562.8929 |
 
From: Shannon Miller <shannon@fab-supply.com> 
Sent: Monday, June 26, 2023 3:10 PM
To: R4_Regional_Hearing_Clerk <R4_Regional_Hearing_Clerk@epa.gov>; Russo, Celina
<russo.celina@epa.gov>
Cc: Dave Ketchum <dave@fab-supply.com>
Subject: EPA Penalty Payment Docket No. CWA0420220321(b)
 
Fabricators Supply LLC has paid in full the penalty set forth in document number CWA-04-2022-0321
(b) in the amount of $20,000.00. The receipt to this transaction paid in full is attached. 
Fabricators Supply LLC
Region 4

Thank you,
Have a great day!!
Shannon Miller
Accounting/Human Resources Dept. 
Fabricators Supply
205 Airport Rd.
West Point, MS 39773
Direct Line Tele: 662.391.1390
Tele: 662.492.0550
Fax: 662.492.0380
shannon@fab-supply.com
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